From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationfwgmail.com=
To: bellaklein <[ G
Subject: Re: Benny Shabtai
Date: Wed, 06 Mar 2013 19:01:50 +0000

ask her 1f that 1s grid price . or discount from grid, we were told that jeffrey normally gets 30 percent off grid,
is that not accurate?

On Wed, Mar 6, 2013 at 2:59 PM, bellaklein <[} G - ot

Please find Nadia's respond below,

Thank you,
Bella

Begin forwarded message:

From: Nadia Gonzalez >

Date: March 6, 2013 1:54:12 PM EST

To: " " <N

Subject: RE: Re:

Thank vou for the email Bella....

As Benny would never take advantage of his friendship with Jeffrey, the appraised value comes in at 78k as
of today.

Waiting to hear back.

Thanks!
Nadia

————— Original Message--—--

From: bellaklein [muillu:_]
Sent: Wednesday, March 06, 2013 11:59 AM
To: Nadia Gonzalez

Subject: Re:

Nadia,

The appraisal came in 51k, so we are waiting for Jeffrey talk to Benny.
Thank you,

Bella

On Mar 6, 2013, at 10:51 AM, Nadia Gonzalez wrote:

Hi Bella,
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Per our conversation, please see attached invoice that was mailed to Jeffry Epstein on 02/12/13.

MNadia GONZALEZ | Controller

Di MODOLO

<img-305233405-0001.pdf=
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The information contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 15 the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all nghts reserved
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