From: Daphne Wallace <[ | NG
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com>, Roy Hodges <]} N
Subject: Re:
Date: Mon, 18 Mar 2013 16:18:29 +0000
Attachments: LSJ] ISMAR CK 121812 $5.887.48.pdf

Greetings Mr. Epstein and Roy,

Please find within this attachment INV 1022 in the amount of $4,300.00, paid to Island Marine & Industrial
Services for work Installation of new moorings as per Permit, as requested.

Respectfully,
Daphne

On Mon, Mar 18, 2013 at 11:06 AM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@ gmail.com> wrote:
send a copy of the mooring invocie to both roy and me
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