
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: ASA spey engine 8520 
Date: Mon, 15 Apr 2013 20:32:04 +0000 

yes 

On Mon, Apr 15, 2013 at 3:13 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 
Darren wants me to confirm it is ok to wire $115,000 to escrow agent for the engine purchase 

Please note that in addition to engine purchase there will be approximately $35,000 - $45,000 of additional 
costs to transport new engine, remove old and install new engine and replace isolators and any unknowns.. 
Our contract with Biz Jet to perform these services is $27,150 (plus $1,250 per isolator that may need to be 
replaced - we have 16 isolators and will not know if they need to be replaced until our existing engine is 
removed) 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York. New York 10022 
tel 
fa 
ce 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Darren Indyke < 
Date: April 15, 2013 1:28:39 PM EDT 
To: "John B. Foster" < 

Cc: "Chris M. lson" 
Subject: Re: ASA spey engine 8520 

>, Larry Visoski c >, Richard Kahn 

I have spoken to John and made the changes we discussed. John please review. Rich and Larry please 
review, particularly the dates, and to make sure you have no additional comments. Thanks. 

DARREN K. INDYKE 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, New York 10022 
Telephone: 
Teleco 
Mobile: 
email: 
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********************************************************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - © 2011 Darren K. 
Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved. 
*********************************************************************** ******* ***************** 

On Apr 15, 2013, at 11:03 AM, John B. Foster wrote: 

Darren - 

In Chris Ison's absence, I reviewed your comments and have replied in the below attachment. Please call 
me when you can - I am sure we can finish the Agreement today and look forward to speaking with you. 

Best regards, 

John 
<2012 E-Card - JBFlightened.jpg> 

On Apr 15, 2013, at 10:22 AM, Darren Indyke a wrote: 

I look forward to receiving John's final comments so we can move forward. Thank you. 

DARREN K. INDYKE 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, 
Telephone 
Telecop.
Mobile: 
email: 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - © 2011 Darren K. 
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Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved. 

On Apr 13, 2013, at 12:36 PM, Chris M. Ison wrote: 

Darren 

I am out of the office on vacation, with limited access to email, so once John has an opportunity to 
review your comments he will be back in touch with you to finalize the document. 

all the best 
Chris 

On Apr 12, 2013, at 5:30 PM, Darren Indyke c > wrote: 

Good Afternoon, Chris. 

My comments are marked on the attached. I am sure we can get this resolved quickly so we can sign 
and fund on Monday. Please feel free to email me with your response or I am reachable by cell phone 
all weekend. I look forward to working with you to get this finalized and signed. Thank you. 

Sincerely, 

DARREN K. INDYKE 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, 
Telephone: 
Telecopier: 
Mobile: 
email: 

************** ******************************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - O 2011 Darren K. 
Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved. 
********************************** ************************************************ 

On Apr 12, 2013, at 10:43 AM, Chris M. Ison wrote: 
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Gentlemen 

I have attached an updated Sales Agreement for your review. 

all the best 
Chris 

<Engine sn 8520 Purchase Agmt Apr12.doc> 

<DKI 4-12-13 COMMENTS TO Engine sn 8520 Purchase Agmt Apr12.doc> 

<JBF 4-15-13 comments to DKI 4-12-13 COMMENTS TO Engine sn 8520 Purchase Agmt Apr12.doc> 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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