
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To: Ivjet

Subject: Re: Privileged and Confidential 
Date: Thu, 02 May 2013 17:51:25 +0000 

yes 

On Thu, May 2, 2013 at 10:55 AM. --- wrote: 
Jeffrey 
should I copy Dennis also with signed letter that Darren Drafted to seller? 

thx 
Larry 

In a message dated 5/2/2013 10:24:21M. Eastern Daylight Time, writes: 

Try this I put it in a different older word format. 

I also copied Jeffrey on this email in case he also could not open my draft from the previous email. 

Thanks. 

DARREN K. INDYKE 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, New York 10022 
Telephone: (212) 971-1314 
Telecopier: (646) 350-0378 
Mobile: (862) 485-6315 
email: 

********************************************************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attomey-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - 2011 Darren K. 
Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved. 

On May 2, 2013, at 10:22 AM, wrote: 
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Not sure what protection server your using, but I can't open this on my ipad or computer, I'm sure others will have 
same issue. 
Can you resend in other manor? 
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

 Original Message----
From: Darren Indyke c
Date: Thu, 2 May 2013 10:14:54 
To: Jeffrey Epstein<jeevacation@gmail.com>. Larry Visoskilla 
Subject: Privileged and Confidential 

Please see my attached draft of our response to TRT Leasing's purported termination letter. Please let me and 
Larry know if this letter is acceptable. If not I will make any requested changes. If so, Larry please sign and email 
to TRT Leasing using the email address indicated on the letter. This follows the notice provision in the Purchase 
Agreement. 

Also, should we fund the full purchase price with the new escrow agent now, so we can say we are ready to close? 
That would be $5,935,000, plus $3,000 which is one half of the escrow fee and another $2,000 to cover the costs of 

International Registry recordation. If so, I will tell Rich and at the same time instruct the old Escrow Agent to send 
us back our $350,000 Deposit. We did not yet pull that deposit because I did not want to be in technical breach of 
Purchase Agreement. Once we wire to full amount to the new Escrow Agent, I will pull back the $350,000. 

I wanted to get this drafted as soon as possible so I have not driven in to the office yet. I will await Jeffrey's 
response before I leave the house in case I have to make any revisions. Please let me know. Thanks. 

DARREN K. INDYKE 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, New York 10022 
Telephone: (212) 971-1314 
Telecopier: (646 350-0378 
Mobile: 
email: 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - 2011 Darren K. 
Indyke, PLLC —All rights reserved. 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 

EFTA00960295



and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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