From: Richard Kahn <||| | RN
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com>
Subject: Nick
Date: Sat, 11 Nov 2017 00:15:09 +0000

No. He called yesterday for 30 seconds and said he may be able to repay today which clearly did not happen...

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
MNew York, NY 10022

Phone 212-971-1306

Fax 646-350-0954

Coll S

On Nov 10, 2017, at 6:44 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@ gmail.com™> wrote:

did you hear from nick today?
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