
From: Eileen Alexanderson
To: 'Jeffrey Epstein' <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: FW: See highlighted text attached re delayed TRA payment 
Date: Tue, 14 May 2013 20:06:58 +0000 

Attachments: Apollo_2011_S-1.docx; ATT00001..htm 

See last section highlighted- re 25% deferral. If you look at the 2010 TRA package I just sent you, you will see on pg 3 the 
25% deferral = $5,331,079. 
I assume then this would come to Leon as part of 2014 TRA (to be paid in 2015) but will ask for clarity-it may be paid in 
2014. 

From: Ada Clapp [mailto: 
Sent: Tuesday, May 14, 2013 2:25 PM 
To: Eileen Alexanderson 
Subject: See highlighted text attached re delayed TRA payment 

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential 
and intended solely for the person or entity to whom they are 
addressed and may contain confidential and/or privileged 
material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or 
other use of, or taking of any action in reliance upon this 
information by persons or entities other than the intended 
recipient is prohibited. If you have received this email in 
error please contact the sender and delete the material from 
any computer. 

Apollo Global Management, LLC 

EFTA00961316


