
From: Richard Kahn 

To: Eileen Alexanderson < 

Subject: Re: 

Date: Fri, 24 May 2013 14:17:28 +0000 

Good Morning 

I just left you a message on your office and cell phone. 
I am not sure if you received my email last night however I wanted to follow up on wire as I do not see funds in STC account. 
Please advise. 

Thank you 

Rich 

From: Eileen Alexanderson 
Date: Tue, 21 May 2013 10:48:34 -0400 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: 

Leon said later this week. 

From: Richard Kahn [mailto: 
Sent: Tuesday, May 21, 2013 10:36 AM Eastern Standard Time 
To: Eileen Alexanderson 
Subject: Re: 

Good Morning 

I wanted to follow up on this email 
Please advise 

Thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 

fax
cell 

On May 20, 2013, at 2:31 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

after confirming with LEon, please wire 16.5 million to STC 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
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constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential 
and intended solely for the person or entity to whom they are 
addressed and may contain confidential and/or privileged 
material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or 
other use of, or taking of any action in reliance upon this 
information by persons or entities other than the intended 
recipient is prohibited. If you have received this email in 
error please contact the sender and delete the material from 
any computer. 

Apollo Global Management, LLC 
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