
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Noam Chomsky

Subject: Re: Accounting of the marital trusts 

Date: Sat, 04 Nov 2017 07:39:22 +0000 

Again. Deborah I would like to know the steps to regain control of the trust if max we to resign . I have asked 
niw three times 

On Sat, Nov 4, 2017 at 12:48 AM Noam Chomsky > wrote: 
Latest from Deborah. I'll wait to answer until after your talk on Monday. 

Noam 

------ Forwarded message 
From: Deborah Pechet Quinan <0. > 
Date: Sat, Nov 4, 2017 at 2:30 AM 
Subject: Re: Accountin of the marital trusts 
To: Noam Chomsky 
Cc: Max Kohlenberg 

Noam, 
Any costs associated with the accounts will be borne by the trusts and not by you personally. As a first step it 
may be easier for Max to specify which account the distributions to you were deposited in to and on what 
dates. Max could you please send us a schedule. 
Thanks, 
Deborah 

Sent from my iPhone. Please excuse brevity and typos. 

On Nov 3, 2017, at 8:13 PM, Noam Chomsky < > wrote: 

I received some information from Deborah that you sent to her about the accounting of the marital trusts. It is quite puzzling. It refers 
to distributions to and on behalf of me. I am unaware of any distributions "to" me, nor "on behalf of" me. And there is no indication of 
to whom the distributions were made and who might have authorized them. 

Can we obtain a complete accounting of the trusts without any further delay, each account statement for the past four years. I will pay to 
have them scanned or copied 

Noam 

NOTICE: This email with its attachments, if any, is intended solely for permitted use by authorized recipients. 
If you are not an authorized recipient of this email, your retention, transmission, disclosure, or use of this email 
is prohibited. If you received this email in error, please notify the sender and delete this email and its 
attachments from your devices and systems. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
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the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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