
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Stephen Hanson

Subject: Re: 
Date: Sun, 05 Nov 2017 22:12:27 +0000 

not sure what you mean. . not proper funding, ? i understood 700k was set aside. . david and the bank will 
want to know EXACTLY where the money goes. cant go to you or david be careful. . get this thing working. 
in 60 days as you said you will know thefuture, . try to sell this pieace of shit in the meanitme 

On Sun, Nov 5, 2017 at 3:24 PM, Stephen Hanson < > wrote: 
No. Not quitting. There is not proper funding 
The tco will be done. It was negotiated on Friday I actually made david and skyland just write a outline and 
all signed it. 
David will actually need to show up and oversee this but should be in next few weeks all complete 

Sent from my iPad 

On Nov 5, 2017, at 3:10 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@grrtn> wrote: 

got a message that you want to quit? is it a negotaition tactic. . 
? we have too much on the line. sorry 
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