
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Stephen Hanson

Subject: Re: Can't talk at this time 

Date: Mon, 06 Nov 2017 01:59:23 +0000 

The pg is still on a default . Not sure what your plan is . Not sure what funding you referenced. 700 was 
Friday's bank number 

On Sun, Nov 5, 2017 at 8:48 PM jeffrey E. <jeevacation@grnail.com> wrote: 
He said tell them what checks to write that make up the 700k . And they will give them to you Tuesday. Not 
sure what has changed since Friday 

On Sun, Nov 5, 2017 at 7:46 PM Stephen Hanson < wrote: 
David said I'll kick your ass first not me 
I'm not quitting I'm just not getting stuck with a restaurant and no funds -
The tco work will be completed - david needs to pay the architect and engineer so they can complete the 
process 
Not sure what your talking about in #4 - the budget is for future. No checks have been issued 
All prior payments always have receipts 
Yes moving forward - agree - there is not the proper funding 
Sent from my iPad 

On Nov 5, 2017, at 7:09 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@grnail.com> wrote: 

1 first you want to have s fist fight. 2 you threatened to quit 3? You need to move forward and relax . You 
are going to have s stroke . 4. Not sure why amounts needed are not detailed with checks attached 

On Sun, Nov 5, 2017 at 5:54 PM Stephen Hanson < > wrote: 

Sent from my iPad 
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