
From: Lvjet 

To: jeevacationggmail.com, 

Subject: Fwd: 1085 

Date: Tue, 02 Jul 2013 19:41:05 +0000 

Attachments: SCI3300_TRT_Invoice.pdf 

Jeffrey and Darren, 
all items have been repaired from Gulfstream that where listed on prebuy conditions,. 
final invoice Dennis is responsible for is 529,984.49 see attachment. 
Dennis is requesting release of funds held in escrow to pay Gulfstream invoice 
is this approved? 

thank you, 
Larry 

----Original Message 
From: Dennis Andersen 
To: lvjet < 
Cc: Kim Reso < 
Sent: Tue, Jul 2, 2013 3:19 pm 
Subject: FW: 1085 

Larry, 

We're going to have IATS pay the final invoice to GD from escrow and release the balance to TRT Leasing, Inc. If you have 
any issue with that please let me know. 

Best Regards, 

Dennis Andersen 
Florida Jet Sales, Inc. 
1516 Perimeter Road, Suite 201 
Palm Beach International Airport 
West Palm Beach, Florida 33406 

fax 
mobile 

THE INFORMATION TRANSMITTED (INCLUDING ATTACHMENTS) IS COVERED BY THE ELECTRONIC 
COMMUNICATIONS PRIVACY ACT, 18 U.S.C. 2510-2521, IS INTENDED ONLY FOR THE PERSON(S) OR 
ENTITY/ENTITIES TO WHICH IT IS ADDRESSED AND MAY CONTAIN CONFIDENTIAL AND/OR PRIVILEGED 
MATERIAL. ANY REVIEW, RETRANSMISSION, DISSEMINATION OR OTHER USE OF, OR TAKING OF ANY ACTION IN 
RELIANCE UPON, THIS INFORMATION BY PERSONS OR ENTITIES OTHER THAN THE INTENDED RECIPIENT(S) IS 
PROHIBITED. IF YOU RECEIVED THIS IN ERROR, PLEASE CONTACT THE SENDER AND DELETE THE MATERIAL 
FROM ANY COMPUTER. 

From: [maillo 
Sent: Tuesday, July 2, 2013 3:08 PM 
To: Dennis Andersen 
Cc: 
Subject: RE: 1085 

Dennis, 

EFTA00964236



Please find invoice attached. 

Thanks, 

Ray Kraber 
Senior Service Center Coordinator 
Gulfstream 
1500C Perimeter Road 
West Palm Beach, FL 33406 

(Office) 
(Cell) 
(Fax) 

This e-mail message, including all attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain Personal 
Information under General Dynamics policy CP 07-105 and/or legally privileged and confidential information. Any Personal 
Information can be accessed only by authorized personnel of General Dynamics and its approved service providers and 
may be used only as permitted by General Dynamics and its policies. Contractual restrictions apply to third parties. If you 
are not an intended recipient, you are hereby notified that you have either received this message in error or through 
interception, and that any review, use, distribution, copying or disclosure of this message or its attachments is strictly 
prohibited and is subject to criminal and civil penalties. All personal messages express solely the sender's views and not 
those of Gulfstream Aerospace Corporation. 
If you received this message in error, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original 
message. 

From: Dennis Andersen •r :. 

To: 

Dale: 07102/2013 02:45 PM 

Subject: RE: 1085 

9999999999999999999999999 

Best Regards, 

Dennis Andersen 
Florida Jet Sales, Inc. 
1516 Perimeter Road, Suite 201 
Palm Beach International Airport 
West Palm Beach, Florida 33406 

fax 
mobile 

THE INFORMATION TRANSMITTED (INCLUDING ATTACHMENTS) IS COVERED BY THE ELECTRONIC 
COMMUNICATIONS PRIVACY ACT, 18 U.S.C. 2510-2521, IS INTENDED ONLY FOR THE PERSON(S) OR 
ENTITY/ENTITIES TO WHICH IT IS ADDRESSED AND MAY CONTAIN CONFIDENTIAL AND/OR PRIVILEGED 
MATERIAL. ANY REVIEW, RETRANSMISSION, DISSEMINATION OR OTHER USE OF, OR TAKING OF ANY ACTION IN 
RELIANCE UPON, THIS INFORMATION BY PERSONS OR ENTITIES OTHER THAN THE INTENDED RECIPIENT(S) IS 
PROHIBITED. IF YOU RECEIVED THIS IN ERROR, PLEASE CONTACT THE SENDER AND DELETE THE MATERIAL 
FROM ANY COMPUTER. 
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From: 
Sent: Monday, July 1, 2013 4:41 PM 
To: Dennis Andersen 
Cc:  
Subject: Re: 1085 

[maiIto: 

Dennis, 
Last Tuesday and Wednesday it seemed there were a couple of questions concerning the predictive RAIM and the 
radome. I also still had an open item with a fuel bill on Larry's side of the invoice. I believe these items are resolved now 
and we can proceed with finalizing the work order. I should be able to have it finalized in the morning. 
My apology for any confusion related to this. 

Thanks, 

Ray Kraber 
Senior Service Center Coordinator 
Gulfstream 
1500C Perimeter Road 
West Palm Beach, FL 33406 

(Office) 
(Cell) 
(Fax) 

This e-mail message, including all attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain Personal 
Information under General Dynamics policy CP 07-105 and/or legally privileged and confidential information. Any Personal 
Information can be accessed only by authorized personnel of General Dynamics and its approved service providers and 
may be used only as permitted by General Dynamics and its policies. Contractual restrictions apply to third parties. If you 
are not an intended recipient, you are hereby notified that you have either received this message in error or through 
interception, and that any review, use, distribution, copying or disclosure of this message or its attachments is strictly 
prohibited and is subject to criminal and civil penalties. All personal messages express solely the sender's views and not 
those of Gulfstream Aerospace Corporation. 
If you received this message in error, please contact the sender by reply e-mail and destroy all copies of the original 
message. 

From: Dennis Andersen < :.• 

To: RaKrabr. 

Dale: 07/0112013 04:30 PM 

Subject: 1085 

Sean Brown 

Ray, 

I was supposed to get the final invoice last Wednesday, what happened. 

Best Regards, 

Dennis Andersen 
Florida Jet Sales, Inc. 
1516 Perimeter Road, Suite 201 
Palm Beach International Airport 
West Palm Beach, Florida 33406 

fax 

EFTA00964238



mobile 

THE INFORMATION TRANSMITTED (INCLUDING ATTACHMENTS) IS COVERED BY THE ELECTRONIC 
COMMUNICATIONS PRIVACY ACT, 18 U.S.C. 2510-2521, IS INTENDED ONLY FOR THE PERSON(S) OR 
ENTITY/ENTITIES TO WHICH IT IS ADDRESSED AND MAY CONTAIN CONFIDENTIAL AND/OR PRIVILEGED 
MATERIAL. ANY REVIEW, RETRANSMISSION, DISSEMINATION OR OTHER USE OF, OR TAKING OF ANY ACTION IN 
RELIANCE UPON, THIS INFORMATION BY PERSONS OR ENTITIES OTHER THAN THE INTENDED RECIPIENT(S) IS 
PROHIBITED. IF YOU RECEIVED THIS IN ERROR, PLEASE CONTACT THE SENDER AND DELETE THE MATERIAL 
FROM ANY COMPUTER. 
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