
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: 1085 
Date: Mon, 08 Jul 2013 13:10:45 +0000 

Dennis Still need to review , sorry. We can release all but disputed amount if you want 

On Monday, July 8, 2013, wrote: 
I told Dennis I'm at Doctor appointment, I'll get back to him. 
How do we respond? 

Thx 
Larry 
Sent via BlackBeny by AT&T 

From: Dennis Andersen  
Date: Mon, 8 Jul 2013 07:49:18 -0500 
To:
Subject: 1085 

Hey Larry, 

I wanted make sure we are all set to release the balance of funds from escrow today, please let me know. 

Best Regards, 

Dennis Andersen 

Florida Jet Sales, Inc. 
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THE INFORMATION TRANSMITTED (INCLUDING ATTACHMENTS) IS COVERED BY THE 
ELECTRONIC COMMUNICATIONS PRIVACY ACT, 18 U.S.C. 2510-2521, IS INTENDED ONLY FOR 
THE PERSON(S) OR ENTITY/ENTITIES TO WHICH IT IS ADDRESSED AND MAY CONTAIN 
CONFIDENTIAL AND/OR PRIVILEGED MATERIAL. ANY REVIEW, RETRANSMISSION, 
DISSEMINATION OR OTHER USE OF, OR TAKING OF ANY ACTION IN RELIANCE UPON, THIS 
INFORMATION BY PERSONS OR ENTITIES OTHER THAN THE INTENDED RECIPIENT(S) IS 
PROHIBITED. IF YOU RECEIVED THIS IN ERROR, PLEASE CONTACT THE SENDER AND DELETE 
THE MATERIAL FROM ANY COMPUTER. 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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