
From: Richard Kahn < 

To: Adam Bly

Subject: Re: Promissory Note 

Date: Fri, 23 Aug 2013 20:17:14 +0000 

What address. When? Please provide tracking number. Thank you. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 23, 2013, at 4:13 PM, Adam Bly

Was sent to you 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 22, 2013, at 5:29 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

wrote: 

Please advise on August 12th payment due in the amount of $12,000 
Thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Aug 15. 2011 at 9:28 AM, Adam Bly wrote: 

Rich -- Following up.... would you kindly advise on the status of this very serious issue. 

On Aug 12, 2013, at 10:23 PM, Adam Bly wrote: 

Rich, 

Can you please advise on the status of this issue. 

Thank you 

Adam 

On Jul 18, 2013, at 3:17 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

We have made all efforts to close this out 
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Can you please confirm that the income execution order has been withdrawn 
Thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: July 12, 2013 7:51:35 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn < 
Subject: Fwd: Promissory Note 

 Forwarded message   
From: Adam Bly  
Date: Fri, Jul 12, 2013 at 3:51 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Promissory Note 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Can you please have your lawyer close this out --

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Vera Savcic < 
Date: July 12, 2013 3:19:50 PM EDT 
To: Adam Bly 
Subject: Fwd: Promissory Note 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Morena" < 
Date: July 12, 2013 11:53:08 AM EDT 
To: "'Vera Savcic'" < 
Subject: RE: Promissory Note 

Hi Vera, 

I have made numerous attempts to contact Jeffrey Epstein's attorney to resolve this matter and close the 
execution in our office however, he has not returned any of my calls. 
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If you send me a copy of the signed agreement between Mr. Bly and Mr. Epstein, I will speak to Marshal 
Bienstock and see what can be done to resolve this matter and get the file closed in our office. 

Regards, 

Morena 

Marshals Bienstock, City of New York 
36-35 Bell Blvd, Suite #301 

From: Vera Savcic [mailto 
Sent: Wednesday, May 22, 2013 2:36 PM 
To: Morena 
Subject: Re: Promissory Note 

Hi Morena: 

RE: Docket B23I273 

Adam Bly has signed a new agreement with this lender so he has asked me to find out if 
they have withdrawn the Income Execution Order and submitted this information to you? 

Thank you, 

Vera Savcic 

COO & CFO 
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Seed 

Adam Bly 
Founder & CEO 
Seed 

NOTICE: If received in error, please destroy and notify sender, and make no further use, 
disclosure, or distribution. This email and any attachments may contain information subject to 
confidentiality obligations, and sender does not waive confidentiality or privilege. 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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