
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Sportis Color Selections 
Date: Tue, 27 Aug 2013 18:09:31 +0000 

I have no color anything 

On Tue, Aug 27, 2013 at 1:59 PM, Richard Kahn < wrote: 
attached is my correspondence with Sportis rep Adam who says colors are 95% accurate on sketch sent 
yesterday 
please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Floor, 

Begin fonvarded message: 

From: "Adam Zygowski "  
Date: August 27, 2013 6:35:37 AM EDT 
To: "Richard Kahn" 
Subject: Re: Color Selections 

These are actual colors with 95% accuracy, as on the computer you do not have RAL colors, you must 
compare with RAL and then select. 

Best regards 
Adam Zygowski 

Dnia 27-08-2013 o 12:32:53 Richard Kahn < napisal(a): 

Ok - are those actual colors or just shades of colors via pencil 

Thanks 

On 8/27/13 6:31 AM, "Adam Zygowski" < wrote: 

Yes, black, light grey and dark grey were selected: 
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Tubes - RAL 7022 - Umbra Grey 

Cabin - RAL 7035 - Light Grey 

Bottom (Hull) - RAL 9011 - Graphite Black 

Best regards 

Adam Zygowski 

Dnia 27-08-2013 o 12:27:37 Richard Kahn

napisal(a): 

No color at all - just black white and grey 

Were those the colors selected? 

On 8/27/13 4:16 AM, "Adam Zygowski" I 

What did not come in color? The mock up? 

Best regards 

Adam Zygowski 

Dnia 26-08-2013 o 23:52:58 Richard Kahn

> wrote: 

napisal(a): 
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this email did not come in color 

can you please resend 

Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Richard Kahn • 

Date: August 26, 2013 11:37:16 AM EDT 

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>

Subject: Fwd: Color Selections 

In a few days/weeks we will be asked for suggestions regarding the 

arrangement of the bow part (luggage compartment) 

Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 
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Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Adam Zygowski " 

Date: August 13, 2013 10:25:03 AM EDT 

To: "Richard Kahn" .4 

Subject: Re: Color Selections 

Enclosed the 2D mock up with colors. 

Brgds 

Adam Zygowski 

Dnia 13-08-2013 o 15:16:16 Richard Kahn 

napisal(a): 

can we please see a mock up this week 

thanks 

Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Aug 13, 2013, at 4:29 AM, Adam Zygowski wrote: 
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No problem, I could just not reach you later on. 

If you have any questions please let me know. 

Thanks! 

Adam Zygowski 

Dnia 12-08-2013 o 19:48:19 Richard Kahn

napisal(a): 

i am really sorry i kept you on hold earlier 

please use light grey for applications 

thanks 

Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Aug 12, 2013, at 5:22 AM, Adam Zygowski wrote: 

I will call you 9.30-10.00 am. 
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Dnia 12-08-2013 o 11:16:16 Richard Kahn 

napisal(a): 

Any update on mock up of boat will look like? 

Is it possible for you to call me at 10am today? 

Thanks 

On 8/12/13 3:54 AM, "Adam Zygowski"

wrote: 

The applications on the tube (fender, lifeline holders, logo) 

shall be in 

light grey (like the cabin) or black? 

Best regards 

Adam Zygowski 

Dnia 30-07-2013 o 23:33:13 Richard Kahn 

napisal(a): 
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Attached are color selections 

Upholstery - RAL 1013 - Oyster White 

Tubes - RAL 7022 - Umbra Grey 

Cabin - RAL 7035 - Light Grey 

Bottom (Hull) - RAL 9011 - Graphite Black 

Can you send us a mock version of what this will look like? 

Thank you 

Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Jul 29, 2013, at 5:26 AM, Adam Zygowski wrote: 

Hi Richard 

Do you already know the colors for the boat? 

This is necessary for us to start manufacturing. 

Best regards 

Adam Zygowski 
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Dnia 23-07-2013 o 18:51:55 Richard Kahn 

napisal(a): 

regarding bow compartment we do not want a bed / mattress 

we plan to use solely for luggage / groceries - assuming 

there will 

be 

some sort of shelves with tie downs 

thanks 

i hope to have colors by end of the week 

thank you 

Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Jul 22, 2013, at 4:32 PM, Adam Zygowski wrote: 

We received the money at our account. 

The boat should be ready within 13-14 weeks. 

Please let me know about the colors. 

Further please inform how to arrange the bow compartment - 
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we can 

make place for luggage, mattress for sleeping etc. 

What will the boat be used for? 

Best regards 

Adam Zygowski 

Dnia 18-07-2013 o 22:40:03 Richard Kahn 

napisal(a): 

I have confirmation that the funds will leave our account 

tomorrow 

somewhere between 9am - 12pm est and then hit your 

account 

I will have color selections by Wednesday next week 

Can you please give me approximate time frames for time 

to 

build 

and 

then ship 

Thank you 

Richard Kahn 

HBRK Associates Inc. 

EFTA00968356



SPORTIS S.A. 

84-207 Koleczkowo 

Rejestracja: Sad Rejonowy Gdansk Polnoc Oddzial w Gdatisku, 
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VIII Wydzial Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475, 

kapital zakladowy: 2.058.170 PLN w caloki oplacony. 

Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279 

Registered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court 

Gdatisk-Polnoc in 

Gdansk. 

Share capital: 2.058.170 PLN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279 

SPORTIS S.A. 
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Rejestracja: Sqd Rejonowy Gdansk Polnoc Oddzial w Gdansku, 

VIII Wydzial Gospodarczy ICRS nr 0000067475, 

kapital zakladowy: 2.058.170 PLN w catoki oplacony. 

Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279 

Registered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court 

Gdatisk-Poinoc 

in 

Gdansk. 

Share capital: 2.058.170 PLN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279 
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SPORTIS S.A. 

Rejestracja: Sqd Rejonowy Gdansk Polnoc Oddzial w Gdatisku, 

VIII Wydzial Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475, 

kapital zakladowy: 2.058.170 PLN w calo§ci oplacony. 

Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279 

Registered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court Gdansk-1)01nm. 

in Gdansk. 

Share capital: 2.058.170 PLN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279 
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SPORTIS S.A. 

84-207 Koleczkowo 
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Rejestracja: Sqd Rejonowy Gdansk P6hioc Oddzial w Gdatisku, 

VIII Wydzial Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475, 

kapital zakladowy: 2.058.170 PLN w calo§ci oplacony. 

Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279 

Registered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court Gdansk-Polnoc 

in 

Gdansk. 

Share capital: 2.058.170 PLN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279 

SPORTIS S.A. 

nd 
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Rejestracja: Sqd Rejonowy Gdansk Polnoc Oddzial w Gdatisku, 

VIII Wydzial Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475, 

kapital zakladowy: 2.058.170 PLN w calo§ci oplacony. 

Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279 

Registered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court Gdatisk-Polnoc in 

Gdansk. 

Share capital: 2.058.170 PLN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279 

---------- ------------------------------------

SPORTIS S.A. 

84-207 Koleczkowo 
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Rejestracja: Sqd Rejonowy Gdansk Polnoc Oddzial w Gdatisku, 

VIII Wydzial Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475, 

kapital zakladowy: 2.058.170 PLN w caloki oplacony. 

Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279 

Registered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court Gdatisk-Polnoc in 

Gdansk. 

Share capital: 2.058.170 PLN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279 
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SPORTIS S.A. 

Ind 

Rejestracja: Sqd Rejonowy Gdansk Polnoc Oddzial w Gdafisku, 

VIII Wydzial Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475, 

kapital zakladowy: 2.058.170 PLN w caloki oplacony. 

Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279 

Registered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court Gdafisk-Polnoc in 

Gdansk. 

Share capital: 2.058.170 PLN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279 

-------------------------------- -------
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SPORTIS S.A. 

Rejestracja: Sqd Rejonowy Gdansk Polnoc Oddzial w Gdatisku, 

VIII Wydzial Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475, 

kapital zakladowy: 2.058.170 PLN w calo§ci oplacony. 

Regon 191726929, NIP 588-18-40-279 

Registered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court Gdatisk-Polnoc in Gdansk. 

Share capital: 2.058.170 PLN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279 
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SPORTIS S.A. 

Elm 
Rejestracja: Sqd Rejonowy Gdansk Polnoc Oddzial w Gdatisku, 
VIII Wydzial Gospodarczy KRS nr 0000067475, 
kapital zakladowy: 2.058.170 PLN w caloki oplacony. 
Regon 191726929, NIP 588-1840-279 

Registered with no: 0000067475 in Regional Court Gdansk-Polnoc in Gdansk. 
Share capital: 2.058.170 PLN Paid. VAT UE: PL 5881840279 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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