
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To: Ivjet 

Subject: Re: Fw: GIIB Offer to Purchase 
Date: Wed, 02 Oct 2013 12:42:14 +0000 

Yes 

On Wed, Oct 2, 2013 at 7:47 AM, c wrote: 
Darren has approved me to sign LOI, do you approve me to sign? 

Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

From: Darren Indyke 
Date: Wed 2 Oct 2013 07:39:37 -0400 
To: 
Subject: Re: GIIB Offer to Purchase 

> 

I have reviewed and I am ok with you signing the offer on behalf of Hyperion Air, Inc. I am in flight right 
now. Landing in Atlanta then flying out at 9:56 to ST Thomas with an arrival at 1:30 or so. 

DARREN K. INDYKE 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, New York 10022 
Telephone: 
Telecopier: 
Mobile: 
email: 

********************************************************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attomey-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - © 2011 Darren K. 
Indyke, PLLC — All rights reserved. 
************ ******* *** ****** * ********* * ********* ** ******* ** ********** ********** ******* ********* 

On Oct 2, 2013, at 7:01 AM, wrote: 

Jee approved sale of giib 
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 
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From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: Wed, 2 Oct 2013 06:24:20 -0400 
To: Larry Visoski<I > 
Subject: Re: (MB Offer to Purchase 

do it, 

On Tue, Oct 1, 2013 at 9:15 PM, Larry Visoski <IIIM > wrote: 
Jeffrey pis find attached from Gary a contract to purchase GIIB for S300K 
please advise how to proceed? this is different purchaser than originally offered verbal price at S200k with 
hopes of a $250k price according to Gary. 
thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPad 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Gary Anzalone
Date: October 1, 2013 at 7:33:40 PM AST 
To: " , Richard Laggan < 
Cannon 
Subject: GLIB Offer to Purchase 

Larry, 

>, Sherry 

GREAT NEWS! Attached is the offer to purchase the GIIB. This is NOT the same 
group as last night, but it is a HIGHER offer! 

I have reviewed the offer and it is as quick and clean as we could possibly hope for. 
We just need to get the logs to Teterboro, with the Aircraft. 

If there is anyway to get this accepted tonight, we can get the inspections started 
within 5 business days! 

Sincerely 

Gary Anzalone - Managing Partner 
E uus Global Aviation, LLC 

(M) 
(0) 

*********************************************************** 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jea@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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