
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 
To: lvjet <Ma> 

Subject: Re: Fw: Fwd: signed GlIB contract 
Date: Wed, 02 Oct 2013 19:14:15 +0000 

Yes 

On Wed, Oct 2, 2013 at 3:12 PM, c wrote: 
Jeffrey 
Attached is contract for GII purchase, Darren is reviewing this today for his markups. 

Darren, 
The LOI I signed this morning mentions a $10k commish paid to buyers agent, the full contract makes no 
mention of this commission, and line 12 on full agreement notes "all previous agreements are superseded by 
this full contract", is this a correct assumption? 
I feel that Gary should pay the $10k commish from his $40k commission, I thought it best to sign the full 
contract before informing Gary that he should bare the $10k commish to buyers broker. 
Jeffrey do you agree with this? 

Thank you, 
Larry 
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

From: Richard Laggan < 
Date: Wed 2 Oct 2013 12:45:35 -0400 
To: 
Cc: Gary Anzalon ; Sherry 
Cannon ; Darren Indykecl >; Rich 
Kahn 
Subject: Re: Fwd: signed GlIB contract 

Larry, 
Further to your request please find attached a draft of the Aircraft Purchase Agreement I prepared. Since the 
transaction is an "AS-IS, WHERE-IS" deal I kept the contract very simple. Once you have all had a chance to 
review and discuss with Rich and Darren please call or email me with any comments or changes you think are 
needed. 

We look forward to to hearing back from you at your earliest convenience. 

Regards, 

Richard Laggan, Managing Partner 
Equus Global Aviation, LLC 
 (M) 
+1 954 304 2342 (O) 
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On Wed, Oct 2, 2013 at 11:36 AM, a wrote: 
Yes please send contract to Rich Kahn, Darren and myself for review, all were copied on this email. 
Thx 
Larry 
Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 

From: Gary Anzalone
Date: Wed 2 Oct 2013 20:34:45 +0500 
To: ; Sherry Cannon< 
Laggan 
Subject: Fwd: signed GIIB contract 

> 

>; Richard 

Thanks Larry, 
I assume you are still going to fax it through as well? 
Also, please note that we are preparing a draft of the Purchase and Sale Agreement. 
Should we send it to you or directly through to Darren? 
We would like to have Darren's comments, if any, before sending the draft through to 
the Purchaser. 
Richard, will send this out on email, as I have to run off to Physical Therapy for my 
shoulder. 

Sincerely, 
Gary Anzalone - Managing Partner 
E uus Global Aviation, LLC 

(M) 
(0) 

--- Forwarded messa e --------
From: Larry Visoski 
Date: Wed, Oct 2, 2013 at 8:30 PM 
Subject: signed GIIB contract 
To: Gary ANZALONE 

Sent from my iPad 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
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constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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