
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

To: Lany Visoski <la> 
Subject: Re: Brooke's Tuition 

Date: Wed, 02 Oct 2013 22:15:25 +0000 

take the commison on the sale of the g2 

On Wed, Oct 2, 2013 at 6:00 PM, Larry Visoski a> wrote: 
Jeffrey, 
for your consideration, My have your approval for a loan for my daughters college tuition? Mississippi College $8,965.83 

thank you, 
Larry 

Important Information I Ask for Help I Log Out 
Student Account for: Brooke Visoski 
Logged in as: Larry Visoski 

My Account 

Account Activity My Profiles Select Student 

Payments 

Account Payment Payment History 

Fayment Plans 

eBills 

eDeposits 

Account Activity 

Estimated Financial Aid 

Currently Brooke Visoski does not have pending financial aid for the selected tent 

Fall 2013 Account Activity 

To sort, click on the desired column header. 

Description Cade Date Amount(S) 

Duplicate ID Fee DUID 02-OCT-2013 10.00 

Cash Payment PCSH 19-SEP-2013 -10.00 

Duplicate ID Fee DUID 19-SEP-2013 10.00 

Follett Bookstore Charges FOLL 08-SEP-2013 119.35 

Tr Heritage - First Time F629 06-SEP-2013 -2,750.00 

Transfer Day S/S F701 06-SEP-2013 -250.00 
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Auto Decal Fee - Year I AUTO 03-SEP-2013 150.00 

Tuition Undergrad T001 26-AUG-2013 7,060.00 

Technology Fee TECF 26-AUG-2013 35.00 

Registration Fixed Fee RGFF 26-AUG-2013 339.00 

Equestrian Fee - Varsity Team EQTM 26-AUG-2013 500.00 

Computer Science Lab Fee CSLF 26-AUG-2013 30.00 

Follett Bookstore Charges FOLL 25-AUG-2013 7.48 

Healthplex Membership Fee HPXF 22-AUG-2013 115.00 

On Campus Living OCLV 01-AUG-2013 3,600.00 

Term Balance: 8,965.83 

Make a Payment

Sent from my iPad 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jetvacationOgmailsam, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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