
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: 

Subject: Re: EPSTEIN / Mercedes 
Date: Tue, 08 Oct 2013 11:02:24 +0000 

thanks 

On Tue, Oct 8, 2013 at 12:58 PM, Marie-Joseph Experton < > wrote: 

I finally spoke to Mr. Santerre from MERCEDES, who just said that they are waiting for the confirmation 
from their accounting department that the amounts transferred are credited on MERCEDES account. I will call 
back again early this afternoon. 

Best regards. 

Marie-Joseph Experton 

Avoca! au Barreau de Paris Sabi( a Bruxelles 

From: Jeffrey Epstein [mallto:jeevacationegmall.com] 
Sent: mardi 8 octobre 2013 12:07 
To: 
Subject: 

can you call mercedes and get the car released ? 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jea@gmail.com, and 
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destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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