
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To:' 
Subject: Re: EPSTEIN / Mercedes 

Date: Tue, 08 Oct 2013 14:21:12 +0000 

She can we collect 

On Tuesday, October 8, 2013, Marie-Joseph Experton wrote: 

I just got confirmation that all amounts have been received by MERCEDES. However, due to internal 
proceeding within MERCEDES, they need clearance for the wire transfer of 70,000 E coming from my 
account in Belgium (since it does not come from an account in your name, but from a lawyer's account with a 
communication referring to your name "EPSTEIN'!). 

Best regards. 

Marie-Joseph Experton 

Avoca! au Barreau de Paris Sabi( a Bruxelles 

Avenue Louise 65 (belie I I) 

1050 Bruxelles 

Fax + 

GSM 
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