From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationf@gmail.com>

To: Richard Kahn <[ -
Subject: Re: Jimmy
Date: Wed, 23 Oct 2013 22:32:30 +0000

Yes

On Wednesday, October 23, 2013, Richard Kahn wrote:

[ spoke with Jimmy who was does not want to come back to LSJE unless paid in full which totals 22,636.

Original Estimate 14,994
Three additional days (@ 2194 per day 6,582
Trucker paid by Jimmy 1.060

Total Due Jimmy before additional 18" 22,636

He would not budge on his position with Ana or Daphne. [ reminded him that his original fee of 14,994
included acting as Construction Manager for entire job which 15 not complete.

He agreed to come back to LSJE if we released 18,000,

He will need two days to complete 18" (1 day of framing and next day to pour)
That additional cost will be 2,194 per day if jimmy is part of crew or 1,300 per day if jimmy does not come

with his crew.

Please advise 1if ok to pay jimmy 18,000.
Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor,
New York, New York 10022
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