
From: Richard Kahn 
To: Jeff Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Invoice 
Date: Tue, 29 Oct 2013 15:52:19 +0000 

she is crazy!! 
please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Tonja Haddad Coleman <MIIM > 
Subject: Invoice 
Date: October 29, 2013 11:41:23 AM EDT 
To: Darren Ind ke <->. "'Richard Kahn' 

Cc: Debbie Fein 

Payment is now nine (9) days past due. I have instructed my office to cease working on this matter until we 
receive payment, and I am not paying any of the invoices for the Mediator or the depositions or the hearing 
transcripts or court reporter fees in advance until we receive the funds we are owed. 

Tonja Haddad Coleman, Esq. 
Tonja Haddad, M. 
Advocate Building 
315 SE 7th Street 
Fort Lauderdale, FL 33301 

facsimile 

Please add this efiling address to all pleadings: 

The information contained in this transmission may contain privileged and confidential information. It is 
intended only for the use of the person(s) named above. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby 
notified that any review, dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. 
If you are not the intended recipient, please contact the sender by reply email and destroy all copies of the 
original message. 
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