
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Eileen Alexanderson

Subject: Re: 

Date: Fri, 25 Oct 2013 18:25:31 +0000 

Monday speak 

On Friday, October 25, 2013, Eileen Alexanderson wrote: 

GRAT docs have been executed. Just orchestrating the note repays to BFP. Just considering all cashflow needs in next 
3 mos. Just checking in re our conversation of fee paid from Leon vs somewhere else since I know we have another 
one due. Should I do the same or not ? 

Eileen Alexanderson 
Black Family Partners. L.P. 
do Apollo Management 
9 W 57th Street 
New York NY 10019 
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