From: Richard Kahn *—-}
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Fwd: P.E. Guerin Invoice # 14541, 9 East 71st Street
Date: Mon, 23 Oct 2017 16:33:12 +0000
Attachments: Invoice 114541 .pdf
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attached is invoice for door knobs (inside and out)

total cost is with shipping and tax 1s 1,525 (including a 17.6% discount)
lead time 1s 8 weeks

shall 1 look for other bids or order

please advise

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Begin forwarded message:

From: Merwin Dela cruz *:_}
Subject: Fw: P.E. Guerin Invoice # 114541, 9 East 71st Street
Date: October 20, 2017 at 9:15:16 AM EDT

To: Richard Kahn </ -

Sent from Yahoo Mail for iPhone

On Thursday, October 19, 2017, 1:40 PM, Martin Grubman <[ - W rote:

Dear Merwin,
Here is a pro-forma invoice for your order.
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Martin Grubman
P.E. Guerin Inc.
23 Jane Street
NY, NY 10014
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