
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@grnail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn

Subject: Re: Billing 
Date: Mon, 02 Dec 2013 21:36:59 +0000 

yes 

On Mon, Dec 2, 2013 at 4:32 PM, Richard Kahn < > wrote: 
please advise if ok to pay 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York. New York 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Billing 
Date: December 2, 2013 3:52:17 PM EST 
To: 

See attached the December billing. 
Charlene Griffith, FRP 
Paralegal for the Firm 
W. Chester Brewer, Jr., P.A. 
250 S. Australian Avenue 
Suite 1400 
West Palm Beach, FL 33401 

The information contained in this transmission is legally privileged and confidential, intended only for the use of the individual or 
entity named above. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you am hereby requested to destroy this message 
and refrain from disseminating it in any way. Any inadvertent transmission of any attorney client privileged 
communication or any attorney work product shall not be deemed a waiver of any applicable privilege or 
protection, in accordance with applicable law. If you receive this communication in error, please notify us immediately 
by telephone (collect if necessary). 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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