
From: Richard Kahn <I 
To: Adam Bly  

Subject: Re: Revised Agreement 
Date: Thu, 12 Dec 2013 18:59:00 +0000 

yes 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York. New York 10022 
tel 
fax 
cel 

On Dec 12, 2013, at 9:31 AM, Adam Bly < > wrote: 

Note is fine. I'm in Paris on business so can send back on Monday when I'm back in office but will have check 
sent today. 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 12, 2013, at 3:18 PM, "Richard Kahn" < wrote: 

please advise on receiving signed note and 3,000 and 8,350 checks 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 

cel 

On Dec 10, 2013, at 4:48 PM, Richard Kahn < wrote: 

please write in the word business and initial and i will do the same 
regarding splitting legal fees i can ask jee however i would be concerned he will get aggravated as i am sure 
you are already aware that he lowered interest rate from 24% to 18% (annual savings of 18,000) 
please advise if i should present to jee 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel aim 

EFTA00979125



fax 
cell 

On Dee 10, 2013, at 12:26 PM, Adam Bly < > wrote: 

Rich, 
Re cure period, it still reads five days not five business days as agreed. 
Can we split the legal fee? 
Best, Adam 

From: Richard Kahn [mailto: 
To: Adam Bly [mailto: 
Sent: Thu, 05 Dec 2013 14:09:33 -0500 
Subject: Revised Agreement 

Attached is revised agreement with new address and 5 day clause in section 4 
Please sign and return via email and hard copy to address below 
Backup for legal will follow today or tomorrow 
Please note per agreement next payment is December 12th with both 3,000 and 8,350 due 
Thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 
fax 
cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Message from KMBT_C253 
Date: December 5, 2013 9:55:12 AM EST 
To: 
Reply-To: 

EFTA00979126


