
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: bellaklein 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Wed, 18 Dec 2013 20:17:36 +0000 

No 

On Wednesday, December 18, 2013, bellaklein wrote: 
Jeffrey, 
Please confirm that I can wire her rent in the amount of $2,000 and reimburse her $15 for bank fee. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 

From:  
Subject: new Reciptes 
Date: December 17. 2013 11:07:44 PM EST 
To: bellaklein 

Hi Bella , 
How are you ? 
Here are new attached receipts for JE 's purchases and other expenses under his name . The total is 321 $ 
. Please could you refund it to my card along with this month rent payment . Also could you please from now 
on count an additional 15$ when you make a withdrawal transfer transaction . As I figured out all 
those times , the bank were charging me 15 $ for every transaction which is an essential for my budget in a 
long run . Thank you ! 
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