
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Ben Goertzel < , Richard Kahn 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Sat, 04 Jan 2014 23:31:43 +0000 

yes immediatly 

On Sat, Jan 4, 2014 at 5:46 PM, Ben Goertzel   wrote: 
Hi Jeffrey & Rich, 

Hope I'm not being a pest ... but, I'm wondering if it might be 
possible to send the $45K (or $60K as was very generously discussed 
afterwards) sometime soon? The $45K was due at Hong Kong Poly U by 
the end of 2013; and during the brief residence of the $45K in the 
Humanity+ bank account, I told the HK Poly U folks that the $$ would 
be en route to them shortly. They haven't complained to me yet due to 
the holiday period, but I suspect they will start doing so quite 
soon.... 

I totally understand that it's the winter holiday period, so business 
of all sorts is not happening as rapidly as usual. But the Dec 31 
deadline is part of the HK gov't grant for which this $$ is to 
constitute the matching contribution, and so it goes.. 

Your help is VERY much appreciated, 

0rx 
Ben 

Ben Goertzel, PhD 

"My humanity is a constant self-overcoming" -- Friedrich Nietzsche 

The information contained in this communication is 
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and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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