
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Valeria Chomsky

Subject: Re: FW: trust - Reply 

Date: Tue, 17 Oct 2017 15:30:38 +0000 

Inline-Images: image001.gif 

no, but i thought you said there was never a request made before. deborah thought money was paid out on 
noams behalf . or paid to an acoount for his benefit. but had ZERO details. just like max. . and she has been 
on the case for over a year. this is a test 

On Tue, Oct 17, 2017 at 5:28 PM, Valeria Chomsky > wrote: 
Thanks! 

Just to understand, is there any difference if it is a first time request? 

 Forwarded message 
From: Jeffrey E. lea®gmail.com>
Date: Tue, Oct 17, 2017 at 11:20 AM 
Subject: Re: FW: trust - Reply 
To: Valeria Chomsky  

deborah, thank you for your participation. yes I require a distribuiton of 550 k from the trust. please tell me 
if there is any further documentation for what appearst to me as a simple first time request 

On Tue, Oct 17, 2017 at 4:44 PM, Valeria Chomsky > wrote: 
Do you understand what is going on? Can they behave like this? 

From the very beginning, Deborah has been taking the position as she is N's tutor under Max's request. We 
pay her, but she seems to be following Max's agenda. 

Valeria 

 Forwarded message 
From: Deborah Pechet Quinan 
Date: Tue, Oct 17, 2017 at 10:16 AM 
Subject: FW: trust 
To: "Noam Chomsky 
Cc: "Valeria Chomsky 

Dear Noam, 

, Gene Landy 

Please see the note I received from Max, below. I have not responded to him as you have not asked for my 
involvement at this point. Shall I respond to him by letting him know this, or would you like to discuss? 
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Many thanks, 

Deborah 

Deborah Pechet Quinn, Esq. IM. 
Shareholder 
Chair, Trusts & Estates Group 
255 State Street 7th Floor I Boston  MA 02109 

e-mail: dpq@riw.com I. www.riw.com BIO 
it http://wwwsiw.com/ 
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From: Max Kohlenberg [mailto: 
Sent: Monday, October 16, 2017 9:56 PM 
To: Deborah Pechet Quinan 
Subject: Fwd: trust 

Deborah - 

I welcome your thoughts on this. 

Thanks, 

Max 

Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone 
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----- Original message 

From: Max Kohlenberg 

Date: 10/16/17 9:55 PM (GMT-05:00) 

To: Noam Chomsky

Subject: Re: trust 

Thanks for the quick reply Noam. I will get back to you tomorrow. 

Max 

Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone 

----- Original message 

From: Noam Chomsky

Date: 10/16/17 9:14 PM (GMT-05:00) 

To: Max Kohlenberg 

Subject: Re: trust 

I meant $500,000. 

Noam 

On Mon, Oct 16, 2017 at 9:00 PM, Max Kohlenberg < 

Forgive me for asking Noam, but did you mean $500,000, or $50,000? 

> wrote: 

Thanks, 
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Max 

Sent from my Verizon, Samsung Galaxy smartphone 

----- Original message 

From: Noam Chomsky 

Date: 10/16/17 6:44 PM (GMT-05:00) 

To: Max Kohlenberg 

Subject: trust 

Dear Max, 

.ca 

I would like to ask for a distribution from one of the marital trusts, for $500,000, to deal with current expenses of mine. 

Thanks for your consideration 

Noam 

NOTICE: This email with its attachments, if any, is intended solely for permitted use by authorized 
recipients. If you are not an authorized recipient of this email, your retention, transmission, disclosure, or use 
of this email is prohibited. If you received this email in error, please notify the sender and delete this email 
and its attachments from your devices and systems. 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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