
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Richard Kahn • 

Subject: Re: 
Date: Sun, 26 Jan 2014 11:23:51 +0000 

one year 100k 

On Sun, Jan 26, 2014 at 6:08 AM, Richard Kahn 
Should Darren draft a consulting agreement? 
1 year term? 
Payments monthly? 
Amount? 
Required responsibilities? 

wrote: 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: Sun, 26 Jan 2014 05:56:37 -0500 
To: Richard Kahn c= > 

I have decided to hire as a consultant to foundation. 
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