
From: David Mitchell
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Fwd: Payment 
Date: Wed, 18 Oct 2017 18:45:18 +0000 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 
801 Madison Avenue 
New York NY 10065 
Usik 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: JP Chung
Date: October 18, 2017 at 1:36:20 PM EDT 
To: David Mitchell 
Cc: Scott Yi 
Subject: Payment 

Good afternoon David, 

As per our discussion, we are expecting the following payment to be made: 

1. 10/19/17 - Payment of $250,000 
2. 11/02/17 - Payment of $150,000 at the minimum if the bank fund doesn't roll out by then 

If the bank has funded, we are expecting the payments to be up-to-date. 

Based on this agreement, we will proceed to work to achieve TCO and rest of the work as best as we can. Of 
course the millwork for the speakeasy will take more time (will get updated schedule from the Millworker) but 
we will do everything we can to finish up everything in the next 2/3 weeks. 

There are some Change orders that need to be done for the TCO. We will proceed with those work after we get 
an approval from your end. So please discuss with Scott & Gary to get them approved for us to proceed. 

This is our last push and will do everything in our power to get you opened and operating. And we know you 
are doing everything to get funded so we will put our trust in you to make it happen. 

Thanks David and talk to you soon! 

J.P. CHUNG 

SKYLAND CONSTRUCTION. 

EFTA00982917



39 W 32nd Street, 4900 
New Y 
Office: 
Fax: 
Direct: 

This e-mail message and any attachments are intended solely for the individual or entity to which it is addressed, and is confidential. If the 
reader of this message and any attachments is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any examination, distribution, or 
copying of the material is strictly prohibited. If you received this message in error, please notify the sender promptly and delete this 
message and any attachments. 
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