
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationggmail.com> 

To: Lvjet <a> 

Subject: Re: Privileged and Confidential 

Date: Tue, 25 Feb 2014 18:41:38 +0000 

ok as is 

On Tue, Feb 25, 2014 at 1:27 PM, Lvjet <a wrote: 
Jeffrey, pis critique 

(should I make mention of our loss in confidence after learning of the large repair scheme that 
was withheld until after acceptance of the LOI? or explain that verbally?) 

Good afternoon Ms. Zippoorah Marmor and Mr. Mathew Redling, 

Pleased be advised that we are no longer interested in pursuing the purchase GV serial number 506 
at this time. 
Thank you for your efforts. 

Sincerely, 

Lawrence Visoski 

Manager, Plan B 
6100 Red Hook 
St Thomas USVI, 00802 

 Original Message----
From: Jeffrey Epstein <•eevacation mail.com>
To: Darren Indyke >; Ivjet < > 
Sent: Tue, Feb 25, 2014 12:07 pm 
Subject: Re: Privileged and Confidential 

tell them no longere interested 

On Tue, Feb 25, 2014 at 1:02 PM, Darren Indyke <1MMI > wrote: 
FYI. Amanda Kirby from DB advised yesterday afternoon when I called about the $250,000 deposit wire transfer that 
the wire was going to be completed by the end of the day. When I called her this morning to find out why she did not 
give me a fed reference number she called back and told me that the wire had not gone out because there is a bank 
wide hold on all wire transfers to Insured Aircraft Title Service. When I asked her why there is a hold she told me that 
she believes that IATS was cited for wiring funds in connection with an arms transaction. She had no details, but that 
is what she told me. Amanda is trying to get an exception because our wire transfer request states on its face clearly 
that it is a deposit on the purchase of a GV aircraft. Amanda is trying to get the exception but does not know if she will 
be able to do so. We could Fed Ex a check, but that does not deal with the issue of having to wire the balance of the 
funds to this title company if we ever were to close. 

Do I call Zipporah and tell her that we need to use another title company for the deposit and tell her why? 

Given the comments that we just got from Larry about his conversation with Zipporah and her trying to pressure us 
and giving us a tiny inspection Window, do I hold off from doing anything? 

Please advise. 

EFTA00983924



DARREN K. INDYKE 
DARREN K. INDYKE, PLLC 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor 
New York, New York 10022 
Telephone: 
Telecopier: 
Mobile: 
email: 

The information contained in this communication is confidential, may be attorney-client 
privileged, and is intended only for the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Darren K. Indyke, PLLC. Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this communication 
or any part thereof is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by return e-mail, and destroy this 
communication and all copies thereof, including all attachments. 
Copyright of Darren K. Indyke, PLLC - O 2014 Darren K. 
Indyke, PLLC —All rights reserved. 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by email to jeevacationOgmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA00983925


