
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@grnail.com> 
To: Richard Joslin

Subject: Re: holtsville 
Date: Tue, 11 Mar 2014 19:30:45 +0000 

doesn;t explain why no refund 

On Tue, Mar 11, 2014 at 3:29 PM, Richard Joslin
Tax year 2010 had overpayment applied of $8MM; 2009 had overpayment 
applied of $3MM. 
Since tax year 2011 has overpayment that is flagged for review, it may 
be that the Service is opening the earliest year with an overpayment 
as part of its review 

No other years should be open (3 year statute) 

wrote: 

On Tue, Mar 11, 2014 at 3:18 PM, Jeffrey Epstein leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
> yesterday you told me 2007? 

> On Tue, Mar 11, 2014 at 3:09 PM, Richard Joslin
> wrote: 
>> 

>> 

> The information contained in this communication is 
> confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
> constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
> the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
> Jeffrey Epstein 
> Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
> communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
> and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
> communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
> return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 
> destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
> including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 

EFTA00985078



the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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