
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: David Mitchell. 

Subject: Re: Life Hotel 

Date: Tue, 17 Oct 2017 10:03:52 +0000 

not sure what this really means. what has the bank said, they are reviewing KYC? why? does this mean weeks 
of bank approval process again? . I told stevehe should be prepared to put up temp money . as it will only be 
either now or later. he makes little sense at the moment. im on my cell. 

On Tue, Oct 17, 2017 at 11:58 AM, David Mitchell. 
It is for the Bank as part of explaining the switch from Arcade 

wrote: 

I need to get a stronger feel on date of his funding and if it can be done by end of week and what can be done 
in the interim 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 
801 Madison Avenue 
New York NY 10065 
USA 
1212-486-4444 

On Oct 17, 2017, at 4:55 AM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

not sure who this is for? it says nothing meaningful. the important questions are how much money is really 
needed? still open. his email as you are well aware says nothing about funding dates. I read the personal 
guarantees that you and steve signed. oy. I cant imagine how stressful this is for you. sorry. not sure how 
you are paying your personal operating. ? talked steve down from a tirade. he also has no idea about 
numbers to complete , payables etc. I was unclear on the status of the interest reserve and its obligation. . i 
saw the loan doc amendment had liquidity requrements. not sure what they mean. 

On Tue, Oct 17, 2017 at 1:49 AM, David Mitchell < > wrote: 

DAVID MITCHELL 

Mitchell Holdings LLC 
801 Madison Avenue 
New York NY 10065 
USA 
1212-486-4444 

Begin forwarded message: 
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From: Lany Linksman
Date: October 16, 2017 at 7:45:48 PM EDT 
To: 'David Mitchell' 
Subject: Life Hotel 

David, This email is to confirm our intent to provide funding in the minimum amount of $2.5MM to Life 
Hotel Pref LLC. We will endeavor to agree to terms as depicted in the term sheet provided by Arcade 
Capital, however those terms may change upon recommendations made by our investment committee. 
Since we are working on very short notice we will fast track this request and provide a final 
determination of our interest on or before October 19th, 2017. 

For the record our relationship over the past 20 years or so will go a long way to a quick approval. 

At this time we have all the information we require to complete our underwriting. 

Lawrence I. Linksman 

Bridge Funding, Inc. 

545 Fifth Avenue 

uite 403 

New York, NY 10017 

O: (212) 884-9350 

C: 

Find us on Linkedln 

This e-mail and any file(s) transmitted with it may contain confidential and/or privileged information. Nothing contained in 
[his e-mail and/or any file(s) transmitted with it constitutes a solicitation or an offer to buy or sell any securities. Use or 
disclosure of this e-mail or any such files by anyone other than a designated addressee is unauthorized. If you are not an 
intended recipient (or have received this email in error), please notify the sender immediately and delete this e-mail without 
making a copy. If this e-mail is misdirected, Bridge Funding, Inc. and its affiliates do not waive confidentiality or any 
privilege. 
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please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jea@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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