
From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

To: bellaklein 

Subject: Re: travel invoices/credit- Lawrence summers 

Date: Fri, 28 Mar 2014 15:53:00 +0000 

yes 

On Fri, Mar 28, 2014 at 11:26 AM, bellaklein > wrote: 
aM ni 

requested to reimburse International Peace Institute for Lawrence Summers flight. The ticket cost is 
$14,158.88. Please confirm it is approved to reimburse from Enhanced Education. 

Thank you, 
Bella 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Camilla Reksten-Monsen < 
Subject: RE: travel invoices/credit- Lawrence summers 
Date: March 26, 2014 1:16:55 PM EDT 
To: bellaklein   >. 

Hi Bella, 
Sorry about that, attached is the correct invoice. There were three because we changed his ticket - Mr. Summers had 
requested the flights be first class, which wasn't available on all the flights at first, but then became available so we 
cancelled his original ticket and reissued the ticket to be all first class. So there was an invoice for the original ticket, 
then the second was a credit memo to say that the amount had been reimbursed (for the cancelled ticket) and then 
the third is the invoice for the reissued ticket (for first class). 

So, in short — attached is the correct invoice. 

Best, 
Camilla 

---Original Message---
From: bellaklein [mailto: 
Sent: Wednesday, March 26, 2014 13:08 
To: 
Cc: Camilla Reksten-Monsen 
Subject: Re: travel invoices/credit- Lawrence summers 

Dear Camilla, 
Please resent invoices for Larry Summers for reimbursement. Originally received 3 invoices for same date, same 
name, same destination. 

Thank you, 
Bella 
On Mar 25, 2014, at 8:02 PM, wrote: 
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> Hi Camilla, 

> Thank you for the info - Bella will taking over from here! She had a 
> few questions regarding the total amount to be reimbursed since there 
> are a few payments to make. Thanks 

> All the best, 

> Sent from my iPhone 

» On Mar 24, 2014, at 10:27 AM, Camilla Reksten-Monsen < > wrote: 

» Hi 
»As discussed in Azerbaijan, attached are the invoices for Larry 
» Summers' flights to Kazakhstan. 
» Best, 
» Camilla 

>» On 20/03/2014 18:23, "Linda Bloch" wrote: 
>» 
>» 
>>>******************************************************************** 
>>> *mit 

>» Linda Bloch 
> 

< 

>» 
>» Important - Please be advised that under the Secure Flight Final 
>» Rules,we are required to collect and send to the TSA, through the 
>» airlines, the following passenger information: Name exactly as it 
>» appears on your government-issued I.D. used when traveling (First, 
>» Middle & Last Name), Date of Birth, and Gender. Please provide this info. Thank you! 
>>> 

>>> 

>>> 

>» 
>» This email is for the use of the intended recipient(s) only and may 
>» contain information that may be confidential. If you have received 
>» this email in error, please notify the sender immediately and then delete it. 
>» If you are not the intended recipient, you must not keep, use, 
>» disclose, copy or distribute this email without the author's prior 
>» permission. If you are the intended recipient and you do not wish to 
>» receive similar electronic messages from us in future then please 
>» respond to the sender to this effect. 

» <INVNO31612FORBSL0022205CNAMELAWRENCEHENRYSUMMERS.pdf> 
» <INVNO31605FORBSL0022234CNAMELAWRENCEHENRYSUMMERS.pdf> 
» <INVNO31582FORBSL0022205CNAMELAWRENCEHENRYSUMMERS.pdf> 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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