From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationfwgmail.com=
To: Richard Kahn *—-“-*
Subject: Re:
Date: Thu, 03 Apr 2014 12:47:05 +0000

35k

On Thu, Apr 3, 2014 at 8:41 AM, Richard Kahn *_-‘-* wrote:
1 spoke with Joshea and received his wiring information
please advise on amount to send from enhanced:

a) 33,975 - covers flights & moving boxes (18,275) + cambridge one time costs such as security deposit, first 7
weeks rent & household items (15,700)

b) 18,275 - moving and flights only

Richard Kahn
HBEK. Associates Inc.

On Apr 3, 2014, at 7:18 AM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(d gmail.com= wrote:

please coordiante jshea needs
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