
From: Eileen Alexanderson < 

To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: RE: housekeeping 

Date: Mon, 05 May 2014 17:40:23 +0000 

Attachments: doc00728720140505123400.pdf 

See attached. Funds for each were transferred from Leon & Debra's account to Foundation account and then payments 
were wired from the Foundation account to each charity. 

From: Jeffrey E. [mailtoleevacation@gmailcom] 
Sent: Saturday, May 03, 2014 1:40 PM 
To: Eileen Alexanderson; Melanie Spinella 
Subject: housekeeping 

Eileen , though I am certain i resigned from the foundation in 08. no letter was found in your files. and my 
name is still attached, please tell us what exactly was done during this time. 
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