
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Larry Visoski 

Subject: Re: Departure 
Date: Wed, 22 Nov 2017 22:59:46 +0000 

boca 7 am 

On Wed, Nov 22, 2017 at 5:26 PM, Larry Visoski a wrote: 
Jeffrey 
Reminder if you decided to depart from Boca or PBI on a Sunday? 

I only need 24 hour notice to request a departure slot, I don't imagine Saturday afternoon Departure slots 
would be fully Booked, 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Nov 22, 2017, at 9:35 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

ask again tonite at 5 thx problay boca leave 7 sunday , we need to keep an eye on the weather. rained all 
day the other day. 

On Wed, Nov 22, 2017 at 9:28 AM, Larry Visoski a> wrote: 
Jeffrey 
Just a reminder if you decided to depart from PHI or Boca on Sunday? 

Thx 
Larry 

Sent from my iPhone 
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