From: Eileen Alexanderson <[ R

To: jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail.com™>
Subject: RE: checking in
Date: Wed, 04 Jun 2014 15:16:00 +0000

Will do.

Also, just an update- IPM POA was notarized this morn but | just spoke to Marc Miller from Paul Barrett’s office and he
told me Leon needs to sign most of these docs even with me having the POA. He will walk me thru them today, | will

summarize for Leon and tee up for his signature when he returns.

From: jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacation@ gmail.com]
Sent: Wednesday, June 04, 2014 11:09 AM

To: Eileen Alexanderson

Subject: Re: checking in

Vs

-

On Wed, Jun 4, 2014 at 9:08 AM, Eileen Alexanderson <[ N - ' oc:

Distribution from Black Family Partners and Annuity payments to Leon were made yesterday.

Mean for APO stock for the day was $24.89. Just checking in-should we proceed with APO | GRAT No 4

today?

Rich and | met with Jeffery H again yesterday, please call when you have time for an update.
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