
From: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

To: Richard Kahn 

Subject: Re: Funding for WS 

Date: Wed, 28 May 2014 21:46:21 +0000 

Ok 

On Wednesday, May 28, 2014, Richard Kahn wrote: 
please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Joscha Bach < 
Subject: Re: Funding for WS 
Date: May 28, 2014 at 4:44:19 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn 

I expect the following: 

tickets: 1200 each 
public transport: 70 each 
food: 1000 each 
housing: about 6000 for all 

—> approximately 15000 

do you know approximate cost of stay, tickets and food for four programmers for month of June? 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
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On May 28, 2014, at 3:59 PM, Joscha Bach < > wrote: 

Hi Richard, 

we are currently preparing a workshop in Cambridge that will start next week and involve four 
programmers from Berlin. Jeffrey has agreed to fund their stay, tickets and food for June. 

For most of the time, they will stay at a B&B, and we can provide the bill/money can be sent directly to 
them. They have paid for the flights already and need to be reimbursed. Additionally, we will need about 
$4000 to feed them. 

I have a US bank account now, so I can use checks etc. What is the best way to go about this? 

Bests 

Joscha 

Von: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Betreff: Aw: Funding for WS 
Datum: 28. Mai 2014 15:36:35 GMT-4 
An: Joscha Bach >, Richard Kahn

rich kahn 

On Wed, May 28, 2014 at 3:26 PM, Joscha Bach
Dear Jeffrey, 

wrote: 

how are you doing? There is a book I would like to send your way; are you currently in NYC? 

The programmers will arrive on Sunday and Monday. My bank account is rapidly emptying, and I will 
need to feed and house them. The B&B can send a bill directly to any address we give them, and they 
have taken care of their tickets (in the hope of being reimbursed). 

is there an assistant that I should contact about the details of the workshop funding? I should probably 
have done this earlier. 

Bests and thank you, 

Joscha 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
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constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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