From: Noam Chomsky {_$

To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=

Ce: Valeria Chomsky f—f

Subject: Re: Follow-up
Date: Sat, 16 Jun 2018 20:19:18 <0000

Really nuts. Hard to believe -- and not easy to assimilate

On Sat, Jun 16, 2018 at 1:16 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@ gmail com™> wrote:
and she added on the phone that the amount was not open to negotiation. ! so nuts
————————— - Forwarded message ——--—-—--
From: Richard Kahn <
Date: Sat, Jun 16, 2018 at 3:43 PM
Subject: Fwd: Follow-up
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(wgmail.com™>

Richard Kahn

HBEK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

Phone 212-971-1306

Fax 646-350-0954

Cell 917-414-7584

Begin forwarded message:

From: Jillian Hirsch <
Date: June 16, 2018 at 3:41:56 PM EDT
To: Richard Kahn <

Subject: Follow-up

Rich,

Just to be clear the $100k payment we are proposing would include the income distribution to which Noam 1s
entitled currently. If in any given year the income from the trust exceeds 5100k, Noam would receive the
amount of income. Put another way, Noam would receive a guaranteed payment annually of $100k or the

amount of the trust income, whichever is greater.

[ will reach out to Harry and request that he confer with his sisters, and then we will email the proposal to
Noam and you.

Regards,
Jillian
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please note
The information contained in this communication 18
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(a gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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