
From: Richard Kahn

To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: tyler invoice 

Date: Wed, 16 Jul 2014 18:16:46 +0000 

Attachments: SHBRK_Scann14071613431.pdf 

attached is tyler invoice in the amount of 3,400.00 
please advise if ok to pay 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York NY 10022 
tel 
fax
cell 

13egin forwarded message: 

From: 
Subject: Message from KMBT_C253 
Date: Jul 16. 2014 at 1:43:36 PM EDT 
To: 
Reply-To: 

EFTA00993988


