From: Richard Kahn _}
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Fwd: EPSTEIN / Updates - REPAIRS
Date: Thu, 31 Jul 2014 17:21:16 +0000

it appears that vendors cannot perform and complete sauna room work until mid September

i tried to push MJ and Valdson to be firm with vendors yet we had no luck with securing an earlier time to
perform work

please advise if ok to proceed with 40% deposit in the amount of 2400 euro to secure Sep time slot?

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

tel
fax
cell

Begin forwarded message:

From: Marie-Joseph Experton <
Subject: EPSTEIN / Updates - REPAIRS
Date: July 31, 2014 at 8:58:30 AM EDT

To: Richard Kahn <

>, "Bella Klein ([
)" <N

Cc: "Darren Indyke (

URGENT
There 1s no possibility before September. Valdson checked again this morming (firm ¢losed until the end of
August - vacation time).

"AUBERLET & LAURENT (ceiling for the sauna room):
Please confirm that vou agree on the attached new guote for the ceiling, so I can send it signed on behalf of Mk
Epstein. Please also indicate how pavment of 40% of the quote (2, 400.00 €) should be made (from Mr

1N

Epstein's personal account in Paris?).""

Please advise so I can confirm for September. If accepted quote not sent and payment not
made, AUBERLET & LAURENT will not keep the scheduled dates in September.

Best regards.

Marie-Joseph Experton

Avacar aw Bavreau de Paris établi a Bruxelles
avenue Louise 63 boite 1 1

1050 Bruxelles

Belgique

Te!
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From: Richard Kahn < >

Sent: 30 July 2014 17:09
To: Marie-Joseph Experton

Cc: Bella Klein ([ GGG ; O:zrren Indyke

Subject: Re: EPSTEIN / Updates - REPAIRS

thank you for the update

i understand that august in europe has a lot of companies closed for holiday

however 1am sure mr epstein will be back in paris before 2nd week of september and would like this work
done before he returns

please advise

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBEK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

tel
fax
cell

On Jul 28, 2014, at 7:54 AM, Marie-Joseph Experton *i'_?' wrote:

Repairs (for the sauna room) are likely to take place during the 2nd week of September, subject to approval of
quotes. Painting work should be completed during the 2nd /3rd week of September at least for the sauna room,
for the rest it depends if the walls are totally dry by then.

Attached, please find the recap the expert of the insurance gave Valdson on July 10th. You should be receiving
through Mr. Epstein's insurance company the official letter giving the information about the compensation to be
received by Mr. Epstein. Please advise when received.

AUBERLET & LAURENT (ceiling for the sauna room):

The expert indicated that the VAT mentioned in the quote for the ceiling was not correct. In order to obtain an
updated corrected quote, [ sent an affidavit on the type of work to be done for the ceiling (see attachment) and
just received today the corrected quote. Please confirm that vou agree on the attached new quote for the
ceiling, so [ can send it signed on behalf of Mr. Epstein. Please also indicate how payment of 40% of the
quote (2,400.00 €) should be made (from Mr. Epstein's personal account in Paris?).

MERIGUET (painting):

WValdson 1s tryving to get a new guote after information received from the expert. This new quote 1s expected to
be received this week.

Best regards.

Marie-Joseph Experton

Avocat au Barreau de Paris établi a Bruxelles

avenue Louise 65 boite 11
1050 Bruxelles

Belgique
Fax +
osv

PS: note that I shall be leaving tomorrow morning for one-week vacation, and that I will have difficult access
to my e-mails on Tuesday 29th and Wednesday 30th.
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