From: Richard Kahn _
e
Ce: Daphne Wallace <G oo o= <
Subject: Fwd: Your Invorce (11710053200 from ProSolar Systems LLC
Drater Thu, 05 Cet 2007 13:55:38 (00K
Attachments: ProSolar Svstems LLC Invoice - 1171005350 pdf

thank vou for the attached proposal

1.did a guick search on panels and see they are online for 443 each and | am sure vou obtain them even cheaper
4 davs of labor 26k to get to 98k77

pricing scems aggressive

lets review together today

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRE Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew Yook, WY 10022
e

1

(e

Bepin forwarded message:

From: "ProSolar Systems LLC" <[ NG -
Subject: Your Invoice (1171005330) from ProSolar Systems LLC
Date: October 5, 2017 at 8:16:49 AM EDT

Invoice Due: $98,000.00

ProSolar Systemns LLC

Invoice #1171005330
Amount: $98 000.00

Hi Rich,

Due: 10/05/2017
Balance: $98,000.00

We would like to propose 140 high wattage solar panels fully
installed with new wiring to each of the 5 grid-tie inverters in the
power shed. All materials are on island and ready to go.

Here is your Invoice.
Flease click on the button to open the invoice.

Thank you for your business!

EFTA00994301



- Brad Spernak

View & Pay

EFTA00994302



