From: Richard Kahn <||| R
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation(@gmail.com™>
Subject: Re:
Date: Sun, 08 Oct 2017 15:21:24 +0000

Confirming 12k bid for 115k ask.

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022
Phon

Fax 646-350-0954
Cell

On Oct 8, 2017, at 7:41 AM., jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@ gmail.com™ wrote:

http:www.ebayv.com/Am/2011-Cadillac-Escalade-ESV-/142512547232  richbid 12k for it
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