
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.com> 
To: Joi Ito < >, Richard Kahn 

Subject: Re: Joscha 
Date: Tue, 09 Sep 2014 17:11:24 +0000 

yes 

On Tue, Sep 9, 2014 at 1:02 PM, Joi Ito < > wrote: 
Hi Jeffrey. We still have some money left in the account for Joscha, but re need to renew his 
contract/appointment at MIT. It will be a year in November. Could you re-up/top-off with another $100K so I 
can extend his contract for another year? 

- Joi 
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