
From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@grnail.corn> 

To: Jermaine Ruan 

Subject: Re: 

Date: Mon, 15 Sep 2014 14:47:59 +0000 

ok for car„ carpet in black 

On Mon, Sep 15, 2014 at 10:44 AM, Jermaine Ruan < 

Good day Boss, 

Suburban: 

> wrote: 

The mechanic gave a verbal estimate of $2,000 to move the existing coach seats back and re-carpet the vehicle. He is 
still looking into adjustable coach chair rails and harness. (He thinks the adjustable solution will provide more comfort) 
The physical estimate will be ready by 9/17 for submittal and approval. 

Soundproofing the projector: 

The additional sound dampening material and the fiberglass matting have been ordered. Estimated date for delivery is 
9/19/14. 

Terrence: 

James and I met with Terrence to review the tower project in detail. James and I also walked the LSJ, tower, and the 
various data junctions. James will give his final report to Rich, if all is approved, the second payment released to 
Terrence and he can move forward and complete the project. 

Regards 

JRuan 

From: Jeffrey E. [mailto:jeevacationagmail.com]
Sent: Monday, September 15, 2014 6:40 AM 
To: Jermaine Ruan 
Subject: 

suburban seat? quietingi the projector. terrance. 
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please note 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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