
From: 

To: "Jeffrey E."

Subject: Fwd: 

Date: Tue, 03 Oct 2017 19:36:31 +0000 

Just got it from Rita.. 

 Forwarded message ----
From: Rita Stepancic  
Date: Tue, Oct 3, 2017 at 2:56 PM 
Sub'ect: 
To: 

Hi — my director called me and said there was a mistake on the prepayment amount. She is having the 
accounting dept go over all the amounts between the 2 units (28D and 35D) and will let me know. I counted the 
days in September you were there that was used up from the first prepayment you made. So probably the 
difference will be for those days. But I will get the details and let you know. Sorry. 

Rita Stepancic 
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