From: Richard Kahn <{
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com=
Subject: Fwd: loan repayment

Date: Sat, 30 Sep 2017 22:44:42 +0000

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

Phone 212-971-1306

co
Cel
Begin forwarded message:

From: Nicholas Ribis < -
Date: September 30, 2017 at 9:05:49 AM EDT
To: Richard Kahn <

Subject: Re: loan repayment

Rich - I am surprised at the tone of ur email after our conversation - u seemed understand what [ was doing - 1
am continuing to work toward getting this resolved- Jeffrey is my friend for a long time and I will not
disappoint him - talk Monday -Nick

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 29, 2017, at 5:32 PM, Richard Kahn ﬂ_'-'-* wrote:

i know you are not a bad guy but vour follow up 1s terrible

after you received money you told us you would deliver 250k of jewelry on the next day - never received..
now 2 months later 1 am chasing vou each day and when 1 finally hear from vou after 3-4 calls and emails and
am promised each week we will be repaid on friday or mondav....

still waiting. ...

please repay loan next week
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

tel
fax

o

EFTA00998611



On Sep 26, 2017, at 12:19 PM, Richard Kahn *i_'-'-* wrote:

just called you again and vou sent me to voicemail
please call me with an update on repayment of 200k
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBEK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

te

fax

n;:n;:l'-

On Sep 25, 2017, at 4:42 PM, Richard Kahn fi_'-'-* wrote:

nick where are we??
last call yvou said we would be repaid by end of last week

please call rm:_

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

975 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

On Sep 20, 2017, at 9:45 PM, Richard Kahn *i_'-'-* wrote:

i would appreciate an update on repayment

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

EFTA00998612



575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

te! [ NG

cell

On Sep 20, 2017, at 3:04 PM, Nicholas Ribis *_} wrote:

Sorry I've been in meetings call later
www.apple.com/support/itunes/ww/.
Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 20, 2017, at 2:47 PM, Richard Kahn ~"~'_'-'-* wrote:

just left you a message on your cell
please advise on 200k loan repayment
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

te] I

fax
cell

On Sep 20, 2017, at 1:21 PM, Richard Kahn ~"~'_'-'-* wrote:

nick please update me on loan repayment
thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
Mew York, NY 10022

o1

fax

Eﬂll-

EFTA00998613



On Sep 19, 2017, at 11:23 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail.com™ wrote:

rich , nick said he 1s repaying the money 200k , no interest, that he owes this week, . please

follow up
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