
From: 
To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: Update 
Date: Wed, 08 Oct 2014 18:22:56 +0000 

To send a wire transfer: 
Company's Name: Bridge Union Inc. 
Owner: 
Bank:Wells Farg 
Routing Number. 
Account: 

Let me know if you have any questions. 

Thank you again. It means a lot to me. 

On Wednesday, October 8, 2014, > wrote: 
I don't have your phone number. I'm at some demo event for tech companies. It starts in 25 min. I'm free to talk 
before that and I can talk during but I will have to step out the room. 

On Wednesday, October 8, 2014, wrote: 
Sorry, just saw the message. I can speak now.

On Wednesday, October 8, 2014, jeffrey E. leevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
Free to speak now? 

On Tuesday, October 7, 2014, > wrote: 
That is great. Thank you. My first step is to get accepted. I will start preparing for the application. They 
require somewhat solid programing experience. 

However, I might not be accepted because I'm not eligible to work officially. As I understand 
"hackreactor" (organization that provides programming class) wants their students to find jobs right 
after because the companies pay "hackreactor" some fees. I will have to tell them that I'm intersted in a 
job, so hopefully that will work. 

I will update you when I know if I'm accepted or not. Thank you again. 

On Tue, Oct 7, 2014 at 1.00 PM, Jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
ill pay for classes 

On Tue, Oct 7, 2014 at 3:45 PM > wrote: 
My phone number is I'll be traveling alone (I'm attending national bridge tournament 
in Providence). 

Regarding the project: it is currently on hold because my husband got full time job to pay the bills. 
He is not motivated enough to work after his work. I've been learning some programming on my 
own but the process is too slow. I was thinking to take an immersive programming class 
((http://www.hackreactor.com0) but I can't afford it now. So, the project is not moving but I'm not 
giving up and will make it happen. I think, if I get better at programming I can motivate my 
husband to to work with me. 
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We could talk more about the project and figure out if and how you can help. 

If those days good, I will go ahead and by plane tickets. I will not need the car, I will take a train. 

Thank you for your willingness to help. I appreciate it. 

On Tue, Oct 7, 2014 at 11:56 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 
do you have a phone number, ? yes i can arrange an apt on any of those two dates. ? is it you 
and husband or just alone. lesley will organize car from airport. if you like ( she is copied on this 
email) also I can help with your project . send details. . 

On Tue, Oct 7, 2014 at 2:54 PM, 
Pm thinking from Nov 24-27 and/or Dec 8-11. 

wrote: 

On Tue, Oct 7, 2014 at 1:09 AM, jeffrey E. leevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 
i can give you a place to stay,in ny just tell me how long do you need it i have a guest apts 
on the upper east side. lets speak 

On Mon, Oct 6, 2014 at 10:43 PM, 
Hi Jeffrey, 

I just want to give you an update. 

wrote: 

I haven't find any non-for profit that will accept money for bridge project. We are working 
on the project but progress is slow. 

I'm still working with a lawyer and I hope we will have some answer regarding my 
situation (if I'm staying in US or have to go back to Russia) in 5-6 months. 

I might be in NYC at the end of November or beginning of December if I can find a place 
to stay. 

Thank you again for the gift that you made last year. 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation®gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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