
From: Larry Visoski <Ma> 

To: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation®gmail.com> 

Subject: Re: BBJ YG006 

Date: Thu, 09 Oct 2014 13:18:11 +0000 

Wow, 
I bet he would agree to 25m, not including the 727 at the end of the day., 
He's desperate 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Oct 9, 2014, at 9:04 AM, Jeffrey E. leevacation®gmail.com> wrote: 

 Forwarded message 
From: Alireza Ittihadieh 
Date: Thu, Oct 9, 2014 at 7:59 AM 
Subject: Re: BBJ YG006 
To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>

The Owner will take $25M now and will give you upto 6 months to sell the 727. If the 727 is not sold you pay 
him the additional $3M 

Thoughts 

V-BR 
Alireza ITTIHADIEH 
President & Chief Executive 

From: Jeffrey E. 
Sent: Wednesday, 8 October 2014 03:49 
To: Alireza Ittihadieh 
Subject: 

at 5-7 million for new interior with all new wood. electric window shades, entertainment, bulheads for bed, 
and new shower , 25 is the right price, sorry, Im happy to give him a lien on the 727 , but one thing for sure 
, the value of his plane is not going up. I appreciate you trying to put something together, 
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